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Series: The John 

Hope Franklin 

Series in African 

American History 

and Culture 

Authors: James 

Smethurst 

Behold the Land : The Black Arts Movement in the South 
 
In the mid-1960s, African American artists and intellectuals formed the Black Arts 
movement in tandem with the Black Power movement, with creative luminaries like Amiri 
Baraka, Gwendolyn Brooks, Toni Cade Bambara, and Gil Scott-Heron among their 
number. In this follow-up to his award-winning history of the movement nationally, James 
Smethurst investigates the origins, development, maturation, and decline of the vital but 
under-studied Black Arts movement in the South from the 1960s until the early 1980s. 
Traveling across the South, he chronicles the movement's radical roots, its ties to 
interracial civil rights organizations on the Gulf Coast, and how it thrived on college 
campuses and in southern cities. He traces the movement's growing political power as 
well as its disruptive use of literature and performance to advance Black civil 
rights.Though recognition of its influence has waned, the Black Arts movement's legacy in 
the South endures through many of its initiatives and constituencies. Ultimately, 
Smethurst argues that the movement's southern strain was perhaps the most 
consequential, successfully reaching the grassroots and leaving a tangible, local legacy 
unmatched anywhere else in the United States. 

 
Series: Studies in 

the Anthropology 

of North American 

Indians Series 

Authors: Victoria 

Howard 

Catharine Mason 

Clackamas Chinook Performance Art : Verse Form Interpretations 
 
Published through the Recovering Languages and Literacies of the Americas 

initiative, supported by the Andrew W. Mellon FoundationVictoria Howard was 

born around 1865, a little more than ten years after the founding of the 

Confederated Tribes of Grand Ronde in western Oregon. Howardʼs maternal 

grandmother, Wagayuhlen Quiaquaty, was a successful and valued Clackamas 

shaman at Grand Ronde, and her maternal grandfather, Quiaquaty, was an elite 

Molalla chief. In the summer of 1929 the linguist Melville Jacobs, student of Franz 

Boas, requested to record Clackamas Chinook oral traditions with Howard, which 

she enthusiastically agreed to do. The result is an intricate and lively corpus of 

linguistic and ethnographic material, as well as rich performances of Clackamas 

literary heritage, as dictated by Howard and meticulously transcribed by Jacobs in 

his field notebooks. Ethnographical descriptions attest to the traditional lifestyle 

and environment in which Howard grew up, while fine details of cultural and 

historical events reveal the great consideration and devotion with which she 

recalled her past and that of her people. Catharine Mason has edited twenty-five 

of Howard's spoken-word performances into verse form entextualizations, along 

with the annotations provided by Jacobs in his publications of Howard's corpus in 

the late 1950s. Mason pairs performances with biographical, family, and historical 

content that reflects Howardʼs ancestry, personal and social life, education, and 

worldview.  

 

Art and Migration : Revisioning the Borders of Community 
 
This collection offers a response to the view that migration disrupts national 

heritage. Investigating the mediation provided by migrant art, it asks how we can 

rethink art history in a way that uproots its reliance on space and place as stable 

definitions of style. Beginning with an invaluable overview of migration studies 

terminology and concepts, Art and migration opens dialogues between academics 

of art history and migrations studies through a series of essays and interviews. It 

also re-evaluates the cultural understanding of borders and revisits the contours 



Series: Rethinking 

Art's Histories 

Authors: 

Bénédicte 

Miyamoto 

Marie Ruiz 

 

of the art world – a supposedly globalised community re-assessed here as 

structurally bordered by art market dynamics, career constraints, gatekeeping 

and patronage networks. 

 

Biographies and Memoirs 

 

 
Authors: William H. 
Turner 
 

 

The Harlan Renaissance : Stories of Black Life in Appalachian Coal Towns 
 
Weatherford Award Winner, Nonfiction A personal remembrance from the preeminent 
chronicler of Black life in Appalachia. The Harlan Renaissance is an intimate 
remembrance of kinship and community in eastern Kentucky's coal towns written by one 
of the luminaries of Appalachian studies, William Turner. Turner reconstructs Black life in 
the company towns in and around Harlan County during coal's final postwar boom years, 
which built toward an enduring bust as the children of Black miners, like the author, left 
the region in search of better opportunities. The Harlan Renaissance invites readers into 
what might be an unfamiliar Appalachia: one studded by large and vibrant Black 
communities, where families took the pulse of the nation through magazines like Jet and 
Ebony and through the news that traveled within Black churches, schools, and 
restaurants. Difficult choices for the future were made as parents considered the 
unpredictable nature of Appalachia's economic realities alongside the unpredictable 
nature of a national movement toward civil rights. Unfolding through layers of sociological 
insight and oral history, The Harlan Renaissance centers the sympathetic perspectives 
and critical eye of a master narrator of Black life. 

 
 

Authors: Sara 

Polak 

 

FDR in American Memory : Roosevelt and the Making of an Icon 
 
How was FDR's image constructed—by himself and others—as such a powerful 

icon in American memory?In polls of historians and political scientists, Franklin 

Delano Roosevelt consistently ranks among the top three American presidents. 

Roosevelt enjoyed an enormous political and cultural reach, one that stretched 

past his presidency and across the world. A grand narrative of Roosevelt's crucial 

role in the twentieth century persists: the notion that American ideology, 

embodied by FDR, overcame the Depression and won World War II, while fascism, 

communism, and imperialism—and their ignoble figureheads—fought one another 

to death in Europe. This grand narrative is flawed and problematic, legitimizing 

the United States's cultural, diplomatic, and military role in the world order, but it 

has meant that FDR continues to loom large in American culture. In FDR in 

American Memory, Sara Polak analyzes Roosevelt's construction as a cultural icon 

in American memory from two perspectives. 

 
 

Black Box : The Memoir That Sparked Japan’s #MeToo Movement 

Black Box is a riveting, sobering memoir that chronicles one woman's struggle for justice, 
calling for changes to an industry—and in society at large—to ensure that future victims if 
sexual assault can come forward without being silenced and humiliated. 2015, an aspiring 
young journalist named Shiori Ito charged prominent reporter Noriyuki Yamaguchi with 
rape. After meeting up for drinks and networking, Ito remembers regaining consciousness 
in a hotel room while being assaulted. But when she went to the police, Ito was told that 
her case was a “black box”—untouchable and unprosecutable. Upon publication in 2017, 
Ito's searing account foregrounded the #MeToo movement in Japan and became the 
center of an urgent cultural and legal shift around recognizing sexual assault and gender-
based violence. As international outlets covered every step of her story—even 



Authors: Shiori Ito 

 

 

documenting it in the BBC film Japan's Secret Shame—this book launched a societal 
reckoning. At the end of 2019, Ito won a civil case against Yamaguchi. With careful and 
quiet fury, Black Box recounts a broken system of repression and violence—but it also 
heralds the beginning of a new solidarity movement seeking a more equitable path toward 
justice 

 
 

The Ballad of Robert Charles : Searching for the New Orleans Riot of 1900 
 
For a brief moment in the summer of 1900, Robert Charles was arguably the most 
infamous black man in the United States. After an altercation with police on a New 
Orleans street, Charles killed two police officers and fled. During a manhunt that extended 
for days, violent white mobs roamed the city, assaulting African Americans and killing at 
least half a dozen. When authorities located Charles, he held off a crowd of thousands for 
hours before being shot to death. The notorious episode was reported nationwide; years 
later, fabled jazz pianist Jelly Roll Morton recalled memorializing Charles in song. Yet 
today, Charles is almost entirely invisible in the traditional historical record. So who was 
Robert Charles, really? An outlaw? A black freedom fighter? And how can we reconstruct 
his story? In this fascinating work, K. Stephen Prince sheds fresh light on both the history 
of the Robert Charles riots and the practice of history-writing itself. He reveals evidence of 
intentional erasures, both in the ways the riot and its aftermath were chronicled and in the 
ways stories were silenced or purposefully obscured. But Prince also excavates long-
hidden facts from the narratives passed down by white and black New Orleanians over 
more than a century. In so doing, he probes the possibilities and limitations of the 
historical imagination. 

 

 

 

 

Business and Economics 

 

 

Advanced Microeconomics: Learning Materials for Ph.D. Students 
 

The content of the learning materials is strongly related to the neoclassical 

synthesis trend, referring to the research results of the following Nobel 

laureates in economics: Paul Samuelson (1970), John Hicks, Keyneth 

Arrow (1972), Gérad Debreu (1983) and others. The authors decided that 

it is worth providing doctoral students of the Doctoral School at the Poznan 

University of Economics and Business with knowledge related essentially to 

competitive and general equilibrium in the sense of Léon Walras. The 

study contains elements of the theory of demand, market structures, 

competitive and general equilibrium in the Walras's sense. In Chapter 1 

the authors focus our attention on Marshallian static and dynamic demand 

functions. Chapter 2 deals with the simple model of exchange, as well as 

the static and dynamic Arrow-Hurwicz models (discrete- and continuous-

time). In Chapter 3 the authors discuss the static and dynamic models of 

the monopoly with an exogenous product demand function, which is the 

basis of quantity and price competition models in the static and dynamic 

Cournot, Stackelberg and Bertrand duopoly and oligopoly models 

presented in Chapter 4. The study culminates in Chapter 5 in which the 

authors synthesize the general equilibrium theory of Léon Walras on the 

basis of static and dynamic models with exogenously defined demand and 

supply functions and static and dynamic Arrow-Debreu-McKenzie models 

with endogenous defined functions of demand and supply for goods and 

services (in a discrete- and continuous-version). 



 
Series: Advances in 

Business and 

Management, Volume 18 

Authors: William D. 

Nelson 

Advances in Business and Management. Volume 18 
 

This edited volume includes eight chapters describing recent advances in 

business and management studies. Chapter One studies how marketing 

actions can help reduce and prevent food waste in developed countries. 

Chapter Two examines whether advertising behaves differently over 

alternative phases of the business cycle. Chapter Three analyzes new 

crowdfunding systems that are emerging in large Chinese technology 

companies such as Tencent and WeChat. Chapter Four looks at the 

influence of a graduate program on students'decision whether to pursue a 

career in entrepreneurship. Chapter Five introduces the Economic Value 

Added model to allow for a cost-benefit analysis of people investments. 

Chapter Six explores how altruism positively impacts a firm's performance 

by strengthening organizational resilience. Chapter Seven discusses how 

advertisers are adapting a strategy of communicating shared values, such 

as support for underprivileged groups, to build relationships with socially 

conscious customers. Finally, Chapter Eight investigates the quantitative 

importance of the presence of shocks to the depreciation rate of capital for 

the magnitude of cyclical fluctuations in Bulgaria. 

 
 

Authors: D.K. Ghosh 

 

Business Laws (For MBA Students) 
 

The legal context of business is a prerequisite for a business to exist. This 

course emphasizes the basic understanding of law concepts as applicable 

to field of management. 

 

Application of Big Data and Business Analytics 
Application of Big Data and Business Analytics uses advanced analytic tools to explore the 
solutions to problems in society, environment and industry. The chapters within bring 
together researchers, engineers and practitioners, encompassing a wide and diverse set of 
topics in almost every field. With the increase in the availability of data, analytics has now 
become a major element in both the top line and the bottom line of any organization. With 
this in mind, Application of Big Data and Business Analytics brings together researchers, 
engineers and practitioners, encompassing a wide and diverse set of topics in almost every 
field. The primary target audience of this book includes researchers, academicians and data 
scientists from a variety of disciplines interested in analyzing and application of big data 
analytics. However, this work will also be of general interest to postgraduates and 
undergraduates pursuing advanced study in big data. 

 

Computer Science 
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Computer Networks and Communications 
 

This book describes computer networks from the perspective of administrators, 

pointing out that the network is fundamentally a private network consisting of a 

single independent system that cannot be accessed away from its physical and 

logical domains. The network may be a public network, it can be all-access, or a 

private network that only a few individuals can access. The book introduces 

computer networks and data communication, which is a system composed of 

interconnected computers and computer peripherals (such as printers and 

multimedia devices). This interconnection between computers facilitates 

information distribution between them. Wired and wireless multimedia 

communications are deliberated in the book. Similarly, there are topics about the 

physical and logical features of a network. 

  
 

Better Data Visualizations : A Guide for Scholars, Researchers, and Wonks 

Now more than ever, content must be visual if it is to travel far. Readers everywhere are 
overwhelmed with a flow of data, news, and text. Visuals can cut through the noise and 
make it easier for readers to recognize and recall information. Yet many researchers were 
never taught how to present their work visually. This book details essential strategies to 
create more effective data visualizations. Jonathan Schwabish walks readers through the 
steps of creating better graphs and how to move beyond simple line, bar, and pie charts. 
Through more than five hundred examples, he demonstrates the do's and don'ts of data 
visualization, the principles of visual perception, and how to make subjective style 
decisions around a chart's design. Schwabish surveys more than eighty visualization 
types, from histograms to horizon charts, ridgeline plots to choropleth maps, and explains 
how each has its place in the visual toolkit. It might seem intimidating, but everyone can 
learn how to create compelling, effective data visualizations. This book will guide you as 
you define your audience and goals, choose the graph that best fits for your data, and 
clearly communicate your message. 

  
 

AI Smart Kit: Agile Decision-Making on AI (Abridged Version) 
 
There are many myths about Artificial Intelligence (AI) relating to what it is and what it can 
and cannot do. The people making decisions on AI projects are often not technologically 
savvy and unable to find easy answers. The spending on and the returns from AI projects 
are not necessarily straightforward. Part of the reason for this is the lack of understanding 
of the impact of critical decision criteria. AI touches on many ethical concepts - data 
privacy, validity, and, more importantly, its potential misuse. AI often replaces human 
decision-making, as managers do not clearly understand the implications of those 
choices. This book provides an easy and accessible guide for practitioners without a 
technological background to understand AI. It guides the reader through the fundamental 
issues confronting decision-makers. It offers advice on ‘how to ask relevant 
questions'using the 15 decision scales. There is currently no comparable book on the 
market that acts as a pocketbook management reference guide for the AI layman. 

 

Education 

 

 Teaching Race in Perilous Times 

The college classroom is inevitably influenced by, and in turn influences, the world around 
it. In the United States, this means the complex topic of race can come into play in ways 
that are both explicit and implicit. Teaching Race in Perilous Times highlights and 
confronts the challenges of teaching race in the United States—from syllabus 
development and pedagogical strategies to accreditation and curricular reform. Across 
fifteen original essays, contributors draw on their experiences teaching in different 
institutional contexts and adopt various qualitative methods from their home disciplines to 



 

offer practical strategies for discussing race and racism with students while also reflecting 
on broader issues in higher education. Contributors examine how teachers can respond 
productively to emotionally charged contexts, recognize the roles and pressures that 
faculty assume as activists in the classroom, focus a timely lens on the shifting racial 
politics and economics of higher education, and call for a more historically sensitive 
reading of the pedagogies involved in teaching race. The volume offers a corrective to 
claims following the 2016 US presidential election that the current moment is 
unprecedented, highlighting the pivotal role of the classroom in contextualizing and 
responding to our perilous times. 

  

 

Authentic Voices: Culturally Responsive Teaching and Learning 
 

This book, authored by K-4 elementary educators, working at a publicly funded 

non-profit charter school, illustrates the power of culturally responsive teaching 

and learning as it becomes embedded in the New York State Education Curriculum. 

Educators, families, and community members contributed to this unique program 

with the goal of enhancing learning environments by applying the languages and 

cultures of their students in their classrooms. Strong, carefully attentive, school 

leadership encouraged culturally responsive teaching and learning with the belief 

that children in this urban, economically stressed area could demonstrate 

significant academic and social/emotional gains. Readers of this book will witness 

culturally responsive lessons, family interviews, and whole school events that 

honor languages and cultures represented in the school. Sample 

classrooms'culturally responsive lessons tied to the curriculum, are presented. 

Additionally, qualitative and quantitative student academic and affective gains are 

analyzed. Moreover, this book clearly demonstrates the talents, vision, and 

compassionate care given to children and their families by exceptional educators. 

A CRTL Montage was created for this book. It includes classrooms, children, 

teachers, family, and community members.  

 

Advances in Teaching Inorganic Chemistry Volume 1: Classroom Innovations and 
Faculty Development 
 

Innovative perspectives on teaching inorganic chemistry 

Inorganic chemistry educators are engaged and creative scholars who are 

fervently committed to improving the development of their students. This volume 

provides narratives from practicing inorganic faculty who have developed original 

approaches to teaching at the collegiate level, including broader 

curriculum issues and connections to the Interactive Online Network of Inorganic 

Chemists (IONiC) Community of Practice. As many institutions have shifted away 

from the traditional lecture format, this volume takes readers through the pros 

and cons of teaching inorganic chemistry in myriad ways. 

This book is full of innovative techniques and strategies for anyone teaching 

inorganic chemistry. 

 

 



Engineering & Technology 

 

 

Fundamentals of Materials Engineering- A Basic Guide 
 

An archaeology of innovation is the first monograph-length investigation of innovation and 
the innovation process from an archaeological perspective. It interrogates the idea of 
innovation that permeates our popular media and our political and scientific discourse, 
setting this against the long-term perspective that only archaeology can offer. Case 
studies span the entire breadth of human history, from our earliest hominin ancestors to 
the contemporary world. The book argues that the present narrow focus on pushing the 
adoption of technical innovations ignores the complex interplay of social, technological 
and environmental systems that underlies truly innovative societies; the inherent 
connections between new technologies, technologists and social structure that give them 
meaning and make them valuable; and the significance and value of conservative social 
practices that lead to the frequent rejection of innovations. 

 

Fiction 

 

 

Everywhere You Don't Belong 
 

A New York Times Book Review Notable Book of 2020 Winner of the Ernest J. 

Gaines Award for Literary Excellence “A comically dark coming-of-age story about 

growing up on the South Side of Chicago, but it's also social commentary at its 

finest, woven seamlessly into the work... Bump's meditation on belonging and not 

belonging, where or with whom, how love is a way home no matter where you 

are, is handled so beautifully that you don't know he's hypnotized you until he's 

done.” —Tommy Orange, The New York Times Book Review In this alternately 

witty and heartbreaking debut novel, Gabriel Bump gives us an unforgettable 

protagonist, Claude McKay Love. Claude isn't dangerous or brilliant—he's an 

average kid coping with abandonment, violence, riots, failed love, and societal 

pressures as he steers his way past the signposts of youth: childhood friendships, 

basketball tryouts, first love, first heartbreak, picking a college, moving away from 

home. Claude just wants a place where he can fit. As a young black man born on 

the South Side of Chicago, he is raised by his civil rights–era grandmother, who 

tries to shape him into a principled actor for change; yet when riots consume his 

neighborhood, he hesitates to take sides, unwilling to let race define his life. He 

decides to escape Chicago for another place, to go to college, to find a new 

identity, to leave the pressure cooker of his hometown behind. But as he 

discovers, he cannot; there is no safe haven for a young black man in this time 

and place called America. Percolating with fierceness and originality, attuned to 

the ironies inherent in our twenty-first-century landscape, Everywhere You Don't 

Belong marks the arrival of a brilliant young talent. 

 

Bodily Evidence : Racism, Slavery, and Maternal Power in the Novels of Toni 
Morrison 
 

The first African American to win the Nobel Prize in Literature, Toni Morrison is 

one of the most celebrated women writers in the world. In Bodily Evidence: 

Racism, Slavery, and Maternal Power in the Novels of Toni Morrison, Geneva Cobb 

Moore explores how Morrison uses parody and pastiche, semiotics and metaphors, 

and allegory to portray black life in the United States, teaching untaught history to 

liberate Americans.In this short and accessible book, originally published as part 

of Moore's Maternal Metaphors of Power in African American Women's Literature, 

she covers each of Morrison's novels, from The Bluest Eye to Beloved to God Help 

the Child. With a new introduction and added coverage of Morrison's final book, 

The Source of Self-Regard: Selected Essays, Speeches, and Meditations, Bodily 



Evidence is essential reading for scholars, students, and readers of Morrison's 

novels. 

  
 

Run Home If You Don't Want to Be Killed : The Detroit Uprising of 1943 

In the heat of June in 1943, a wave of destructive and deadly civil unrest took place in the 
streets of Detroit. The city was under the pressures of both wartime industrial production 
and the nascent civil rights movement, setting the stage for massive turmoil and racial 
violence. Thirty-four people were killed, most of whom were Black, and over half of these 
were killed by police. Two thousand people were arrested, and over seven hundred 
sustained injuries requiring treatment at local hospitals. Property damage was estimated 
to be nearly $2 million. With Run Home If You Don't Want to Be Killed, Rachel Marie-
Crane Williams delivers a graphic retelling of the racism and tension leading up to the 
violence of those summer days. By incorporating firsthand accounts collected by the 
NAACP and telling them through a combination of hand-drawn images, historical 
dialogue, and narration, Williams makes the history and impact of these events 
immediate, and in showing us what happened, she reminds us that many issues of the 
time—police brutality, state-sponsored oppression, economic disparity, white 
supremacy—plague our country to this day. 

 

History 

 

 

After the Holocaust 
 
The chapters in this volume examine a few facets in the drama of how the survivors of the 
Holocaust contended with life after the darkest night in Jewish history. They include the 
Earl Harrison mission and significant report, the effort to keep Europe's borders open to 
refugee infiltration, the murder of the first Jew in Germany after V-E Day and its aftermath, 
and the iconic sculptures of Nathan Rapoport and Poland's landscape of Holocaust 
memory up to the present day. Joining extensive archival research and a limpid prose, 
Professor Monty Noam Penkower again displays a definitive mastery of his craft 

 

African American Studies 
 
A comprehensive and practical text on teaching, understanding and practicing 

African American Studies. 



 

Ancient Greeks at War : Warfare in the Classical World From Agamemnon to 
Alexander 
 
Expert Simon Elliott considers the different fighting styles of Greek armies and 

discusses how Greek battles unfolded.Ancient Greeks at War is a lavishly 

illustrated tour de force covering every aspect of warfare in the Ancient Greek 

world from the beginnings of Greek civilization through to its assimilation into the 

ever expanding world of Rome. As such it begins with the onset Minoan culture on 

Crete around 2,000 BC, then covers the arrival of the Mycenaean civilization and 

the ensuing Late Bronze Age Collapse, before moving on to Dark Age and Archaic 

Greece. This sets the scene for the flowering of Classical Greek civilization, as told 

through detailed narratives of the Greek and Persian Wars, Peloponnesian Wars 

and the rise of Thebes as a major power.The book then moves on to the onset of 

Macedonian domination under Philip II, before focusing in detail on the exploits of 

his son Alexander the Great, the all-conquering hero of the ancient world. His 

legacy was the Hellenistic world with its multiple, never ending series of conflicts 

that took place over a huge territory, ranging from Italy in the west all the way to 

India in the east. Those covered include the various Wars of the Successors, the 

rise of the Bactrian-Greek and Indo-Greek kingdoms, the various wars between 

the Antigonid Macedonian, Seleucid and Ptolemaic kingdoms, and later the onset 

of the clash of cultures between the rising power of Rome in the west and the 

Hellenistic kingdoms. In the long run the latter proved unable to match Rome's 

insatiable desire for conquest in the eastern Mediterranean, and this together with 

the rise of Parthia in the east ensured that one by one the Hellenistic kingdoms 

and states fell. The book ends with the destruction of Corinth in 146 BC after the 

defeat by Rome of the Achaean League. The conclusion considers the legacy of the 

Ancients Greeks in the Roman world, and subsequently. 

 
 

Africa's Last Colonial Currency : The CFA Franc Story 
 
Colonialism persists in many African countries due to the continuation of imperial 
monetary policy. This is the little-known account of the CFA Franc and economic 
imperialism. The CFA Franc was created in 1945, binding fourteen African states and split 
into two monetary zones. Why did French colonial authorities create it and how does it 
work? Why was independence not extended to monetary sovereignty for former French 
colonies? Through an exploration of the genesis of the currency and an examination of 
how the economic system works, the authors seek to answer these questions and more. 
As protests against the colonial currency grow, the need for myth-busting on the CFA 
Franc is vital and this exposé of colonial infrastructure proves that decolonisation is 
unfinished business. 

 

 

Law 

 

 

Asylum and Sanctuary in History and Law : A Social and Political Approach to 
Temporary Protections Around the World 
 
This book explores the history and evolution of sanctuary and asylum as a legal 

concept including treaties, laws, and court rulings by major geographic areas 

around the world, influences of Hebrew [Old Testament], classical sanctuary 

theory and practices, 



 
 

Birthing a Movement : Midwives, Law, and the Politics of Reproductive Care 
 
Rich, personal stories shed light on midwives at the frontier of women's reproductive 
rights. Midwives in the United States live and work in a complex regulatory environment 
that is a direct result of state and medical intervention into women's reproductive capacity. 
In Birthing a Movement, Renée Ann Cramer draws on over a decade of ethnographic and 
archival research to examine the interactions of law, politics, and activism surrounding 
midwifery care. Framed by gripping narratives from midwives across the country, she 
parses out the often-paradoxical priorities with which they must engage—seeking formal 
professionalization, advocating for reproductive justice, and resisting state-centered 
approaches. Currently, professional midwives are legal and regulated in their practice in 
32 states and illegal in eight, where their practice could bring felony convictions and 
penalties that include imprisonment. In the remaining ten states, Certified Professional 
Midwives (CPMs) are unregulated, but nominally legal. By studying states where CPMs 
have differing legal statuses, Cramer makes the case that midwives and their clients 
engage in various forms of mobilization—at times simultaneous, and at times 
inconsistent—to facilitate access to care, autonomy in childbirth, and the articulation of 
women's authority in reproduction. This book brings together literatures not frequently in 
conversation with one another, on regulation, mobilization, health policy, and gender, 
offering a multifaceted view of the experiences and politics of American midwifery, and 
promising rich insights to a wide array of scholars, activists, healthcare professionals alike. 

 

Mathematics 

 

 

Boolean Logic, Expressions and Theories: An Overview 
 
The Boolean function network is a systematical approach proposed for the 

inference of gene regulatory networks and related Boolean functions. This 

procedure utilizes two steps to integrate the hidden Markov model, likelihood ratio 

test and Boolean functions for discovering direct pairwise relations between genes 

from time-course transcriptome data. In this compilation, the authors justify the 

need for this novel approach and describe the inference procedure. Next, an 

extended Boolean logic is introduced, denoted by LLT, called “star-finite” or 

“hyperfinite” logic. LLT is closely related to infinitary logics, which have been 

investigated extensively. Lastly, generalized Boolean functions are introduced, and 

an overview with regard to constructions of Golay complementary sequences from 

generalized Boolean functions is given. 

 

Philosophy 

 

 

Conversations on Violence : An Anthology 
 
Brad Evans in one of the brightest critical minds of his generation'- Henry A. Giroux 

Whether physical or metaphorical, institutional or interpersonal, violence is 

everywhere. A seemingly immutable fact of life, it is nonetheless rarely engaged 

with at the conceptual level. What does violence actually mean? And is it an 

inevitable part of the human condition? Conversations on Violence brings together 

many of the world's leading critical scholars, artists, writers and cultural producers 

to provide a kaleidoscopic exploration of the concept of violence. Through in-depth 

interviews with thirty figures including Marina Abramovic, Russell Brand and Simon 

Critchley, Brad Evans and Adrian Parr interrogate violence in all its manifestations, 

including its role in politics, art, gender discrimination and decolonisation. 

Provocative, eye-opening and bracingly original, Conversations on Violence sheds 

light on a defining political and ethical concern of our age. 



  
 

Being and Its Surroundings 

Gianni Vattimo, one of Europe's foremost contemporary philosophers and most famously 
associated with the concept of weak thought, explores theoretical and practical issues 
flowing from his fundamental rejection of the traditional Western understanding of Being as 
an absolute, unchanging, and transcendent reality. The essays in this book move within the 
surroundings of Being without constructing a systematic, definitive analysis of the topic. In 
Being and Its Surroundings, Vattimo continues his career-long exploration of the philosophy 
of Martin Heidegger, in particular his repudiation of metaphysics with its presupposition of 
the existence of permanent, universal truth, and that of Friedrich Nietzsche, with its 
promotion of nihilism. One consequence of problematizing the idea of an attainable truth is 
the relativization of values and cultures. In the face of the death of God – or the absence of 
a transcendent guarantor of the validity of human judgments – we have the postmodern 
tendency to see all value systems and assertions of truth as purely subjective, and to 
suggest that'anything goes,'which Nietzsche called passive nihilism. Vattimo advocates a 
more active response as he challenges all forms of authoritarianism in the world today. He 
brings his intellectual acumen to bear on such urgent issues as globalization, the clash of 
civilizations and terrorism, the crisis of democracy, and the relevance of orthodox religion. 
Rather than endorse dogmatism or indifference and detachment from social engagement in 
the name of relativism, Vattimo opts for the path of meaningful dialogue and a search for a 
mediated consensus based on reason, with all its limitations. 

 

Does God Exist? : A History of Answers to the Question 
 

Human-animal studies is an interdisciplinary field that explores the spaces that 

animals occupy in human social and cultural worlds. It examines the interactions 

humans and animals have with each other and the ways animal lives intersect with 

human societies. Since existing social orders rely on the exploitation of animals to 

serve human needs, the questions posed by human-animal studies touch upon a 

wide range of fundamental issues. Animals and Society provides a broad overview 

of this rapidly growing field. Margo DeMello offers students and scholars a holistic 

and comprehensive picture of the state of inquiry into the relationships that exist 

between humans and other animals. She considers interactions between animals 

and humans in social organizations, such as the family, the legal system, and 

political and religious institutions. A major focus is the social construction of animals 

in world cultures and the way in which these social meanings are used to reinforce 

and perpetuate hierarchical human relationships such as racism, sexism, and class 

privilege. The book also examines how different human groups construct a range of 

identities for themselves and for others through animals. This second edition of 

Animals and Society is fully updated and expanded throughout, enhancing the 

book's relevance for student and activist readers alike. It includes many new 

international examples, all-new case studies, and updated supplementary readings. 

 

Reference 

 

 

Heraldic Hierarchies : Identity, Status and State Intervention in Early Modern 
Heraldry 
 

The social use and changing character of armorial display in the early modern 

period Early modern heraldry was far from a nostalgic remnant from a feudal past. 

From the Reformation to the French Revolution, aspiring men seized on these 

signs to position themselves in a changing society, imbuing heraldic tradition with 

fresh meaning. Whereas post-medieval developments are all too often described in 

terms of decadence and stifling formality, recent studies rightly stress the dynamic 

capacity of bearing arms. Heraldic Hierarchies aims to correct former 

misconceptions. Contributing authors rethink the influence of shifting notions of 



nobility on armorial display and expand this topic to heraldry's share in shaping 

and contesting status. Moreover, addressing a common thread, the volume 

explores how emerging states turned the heraldic experience into an instrument of 

power and policy. Contributing to debates on social and noble identity, Heraldic 

Hierarchies uncovers a vital and surprising aspect of the pre-modern hierarchical 

world. 

 

A Nation of Descendants : Politics and the Practice of Genealogy in U.S. History 
 
From family trees written in early American bibles to birther conspiracy theories, 

genealogy has always mattered in the United States, whether for taking stock of 

kin when organizing a family reunion or drawing on membership—by blood or 

other means—to claim rights to land, inheritances, and more. And since the advent 

of DNA kits that purportedly trace genealogical relations through genetics, millions 

of people have used them to learn about their medical histories, biological 

parentage, and ethnic background. A Nation of Descendants traces 

Americans'fascination with tracking family lineage through three centuries. 

Francesca Morgan examines how specific groups throughout history grappled with 

finding and recording their forebears, focusing on Anglo-American white, Mormon, 

African American, Jewish, and Native American people. Morgan also describes how 

individuals and researchers use genealogy for personal and scholarly purposes, 

and she explores how local businesspeople, companies like Ancestry.com, and 

Henry Louis Gates Jr.'s Finding Your Roots series powered the commercialization 

and commodification of genealogy. 

 

Religion 

 

 

Death & Dying in Hispanic Worlds : The Nexus of Religions, Cultural Traditions, 
and the Arts 
 
The dispassionate intellectual examination of the concepts of death & dying 

contrasts dramatically with the emotive grieving process experienced by those who 

mourn. Death & dying are binary concepts in human cultures. Cultural differences 

reveal their mutual exclusiveness in philosophical outlook, language, and much 

more. Other sets of binaries come into play under intellectual consideration and 

emotive behavior, which further divide and shape perceptions, beliefs, and actions 

of individuals and groups. The presence or absence of religious beliefs about life 

and death, and disposition of the body and/or soul, are prime distinctions. Likewise 

the age-old binary of reason vs. faith. To many observers, the topic of death and 

dying in the Hispanic cultural tradition is usually limited to that of Mexico and its 

transmogrified religious festival day of Dia de los Muertos. The studies presented 

in the ten chapters, and editorial introductions to the themes of the book, seek to 

widen this representation, and set forth the implications of the binary aspects of 

death and dying in numerous cultures throughout the so-called Hispanic world, 

including indigenous and European-derived beliefs and practices in religion, 

society, art, film & literature. Contributions include engagement with the pre-

Hispanic world, Picassos poetry, cultural norms in Cuba, and the literary works of 

Jorge Luis Borges and Gabriel Garcia Marquez. Underlying the arguments 

presented is Saussurean structuralist theory, which provides a platform to 

disentangle cultural context in comparative settings. 

 



 

The Art of Indigenous Inculturation: Grace on the Edge of Genius 
 
'The inculturation of the Christian message is examined through examples of art 

from Africa, the Philippines, and the Mexican-American community' 

 

Black Indians and Freedmen : The African Methodist Episcopal Church and 
Indigenous Americans, 1816-1916 
 

 

Often seen as ethnically monolithic, the African Methodist Episcopal (AME) Church 

in fact successfully pursued evangelism among diverse communities of indigenous 

peoples and Black Indians. Christina Dickerson-Cousin tells the little-known story 

of the AME Church's work in Indian Territory, where African Methodists engaged 

with people from the Five Civilized Tribes (Cherokees, Creeks, Choctaws, 

Chickasaws, and Seminoles) and Black Indians from various ethnic backgrounds. 

These converts proved receptive to the historically Black church due to its 

traditions of self-government and resistance to white hegemony, and its strong 

support of their interests. The ministers, guided by the vision of a racially and 

ethnically inclusive Methodist institution, believed their denomination the best 

option for the marginalized people. Dickerson-Cousin also argues that the religious 

opportunities opened up by the AME Church throughout the West provided another 

impetus for Black migration. Insightful and richly detailed, Black Indians and 

Freedmen illuminates how faith and empathy encouraged the unique interactions 

between two peoples. 

  

 

Sciences 

 

 

Academic Biology -IX 
 

Academic Biology Book 



  
 

Advancement in the Cancer Treatment 
 
Cancer: It is a disease where our body cells loose ability to divide at normal rate, this 
abnormal growth of cells results formation of lumps or tumours in body. Depending on the 
stage of the cancer and condition of the patient, treatment for the disease is decided. 
Treatment is given either to cure the disease or to shrink the tumour size or slow down 
the growth of disease allowing patient to live a normal life or live symptom free if possible. 
General treatment options available for treating cancer include: Surgery, Chemotherapy, 
Radiation therapy, Immunotherapy. In this book, discusses some of the advances made 
in the field of cancer treatment. 

  
 

Amino Acids, Peptides and Proteins : Volume 44 

Amino Acids, Peptides and Proteins is a broad ranging title comprising comprehensive 
and critical reviews of significant developments at the biology and chemistry interface. 
Compiled by leading researchers in their subject, this volume incorporates current trends 
and emerging areas in topics ranging from enzymatic halogenation, unnatural amino 
acids in peptide and protein chemistry and detection of protein post-translational 
modifications by mass spectrometry. Appealing broadly to researchers in academia and 
industry, it will be of great benefit to any researcher wanting a succinct reference in this 
field and looking at the future. 

 

Social Sciences 

 

  
 

Antisemitism on the Rise : The 1930s and Today 
 
We live in uncertain and unsettling times. Tragically, today's global culture is rife with 
violent bigotry, nationalism, and antisemitism. The rhetoric is not new; it is grounded in 
attitudes and values from the 1930s and the 1940s in Europe and the United 
States.Antisemitism on the Rise is a collection of essays by some of the world's leading 
experts, including Joseph Bendersky, Jean Cahan, R. Amy Elman, Leonard Greenspoon, 
and Jürgen Matthäus, regarding two key moments in antisemitic history: the interwar 
period and today. Ari Kohen and Gerald J. Steinacher have collected important examples 
on this crucial topic to illustrate new research findings and learning techniques that have 
become increasingly vital with the recent rise of white supremacist movements, many of 
which have a firm root in antisemitism. Part 1 focuses on the antisemitic beliefs and ideas 
that were predominant during the 1930s and 1940s, while part 2 draws comparisons 
between this period and today, including examples of ways to teach others about 
contemporary antisemitism. The volume seeks to inform readers about the historical 
progression of antisemitism and in doing so asks readers to think about what is at stake 
and how to bridge the gap between research and teaching. 



  
 

12 Lenses Into Diversity in South Africa 
 
Drawing on the insights of numerous academic leaders, 12 Lenses into Diversity in South 
Africa will help you facilitate constructive and open discussions around important issues, 
such as: • The narratives of racism in South Africa. • Critical reflections on privilege and 
complicity in South Africa. • Employment equity legislation: A review of progress between 
1999 and 2020. • Gender identity and transformation in South Africa: Past, present and 
future. • Gender inequality at work. • Responding to gender-based violence in South 
Africa: Lessons from higher education. • Diversity in the workplace through a generational 
lens. • Inclusive solutions to mental health challenges: Creative resistance from the 
margins. • Ubuntu ethics and human rights: Implications for rehabilitation practices in 
indigenous African families of persons with disabilities (PWDs). • Religious diversity and 
social cohesion: The importance of mediated inter-group contact in the workplace in 
South Africa. 12 Lenses into Diversity in South Africa calls for responsible inclusion from 
all – individually and organisationally, by ordinary citizens as well as those in positions of 
power. In harnessing the best of our African, Western heritage and Eastern heritage, we 
can create a brighter future for all who live and work in South Africa. 

  
 

Africa and the Disruptions of the Twenty-first Century 

 
This collection of essays interrogates the repositioning of Africa and its diasporas in the 
unfolding disruptive transformations of the early twenty-first century. It is divided into five 
parts focusing on America's racial dysfunctions, navigating global turbulence, Africa's 
political dramas, the continent's persistent mythologisation and disruptions in higher 
education. It closes with tributes to two towering African public intellectuals, Ali Mazrui 
and Thandika Mkandawire, who have since joined the ancestors. 

 

To Address You As My Friend : African Americans' Letters to Abraham Lincoln 
 

Many African Americans of the Civil War era felt a personal connection to Abraham 

Lincoln. For the first time in their lives, an occupant of the White House seemed 

concerned about the welfare of their race. Indeed, despite the tremendous 

injustice and discrimination that they faced, African Americans now had 

confidence to write to the president and to seek redress of their grievances. Their 

letters express the dilemmas, doubts, and dreams of both recently enslaved and 

free people in the throes of dramatic change. For many, writing Lincoln was a last 

resort. Yet their letters were often full of determination, making explicit claims to 

the rights of U.S. citizenship in a wide range of circumstances. This compelling 

collection presents more than 120 letters from African Americans to Lincoln, most 

of which have never before been published. They offer unflinching, intimate, and 

often heart-wrenching portraits of Black soldiers’ and civilians’ experiences in 

wartime. As readers continue to think critically about Lincoln's image as the 'Great 

Emancipator,' this book centers African Americans' own voices to explore how 

they felt about the president and how they understood the possibilities and limits 

of the power vested in the federal government. 

 

 

 



 

Bidding for the 1968 Olympic Games : International Sport's Cold War Battle 
with NATO 
 

During the Cold War, political tensions associated with the division of Germany 

came to influence the world of competitive sport. In the 1950s, West Germany 

and its NATO allies refused to recognize the communist East German state and 

barred its national teams from sporting competitions. The construction of the 

Berlin Wall in 1961 further exacerbated these pressures, with East German teams 

denied travel to several world championships. These tensions would only intensify 

in the run-up to the 1968 Olympics. In Bidding for the 1968 Olympic Games, 

Heather L. Dichter considers how NATO and its member states used sport as a 

diplomatic arena during the height of the Cold War, and how international sport 

responded to political interference. Drawing on archival materials from NATO, 

foreign ministries, domestic and international sport functionaries, and 

newspapers, Dichter examines controversies surrounding the 1968 Summer and 

Winter Olympic Games, particularly the bidding process between countries to host 

the events. As she demonstrates, during the Cold War sport and politics became 

so intertwined that they had the power to fundamentally transform each other. 

  
 

Black Cowboys of Rodeo : Unsung Heroes From Harlem to Hollywood and the 
American West 
 
They ride horses, rope calves, buck broncos, ride and fight bulls, and even wrestle steers. 
They are Black cowboys, and the legacies of their pursuits intersect with those of 
America's struggle for racial equality, human rights, and social justice. Keith Ryan 
Cartwright brings to life the stories of such pioneers as Cleo Hearn, the first Black cowboy 
to professionally rope in the Rodeo Cowboy Association; Myrtis Dightman, who became 
known as the Jackie Robinson of Rodeo after being the first Black cowboy to qualify for 
the National Finals Rodeo; and Tex Williams, the first Black cowboy to become a state 
high school rodeo champion in Texas.Black Cowboys of Rodeo is a collection of one 
hundred years of stories, told by these revolutionary Black pioneers themselves and set 
against the backdrop of Reconstruction, Jim Crow, segregation, the civil rights movement, 
and eventually the integration of a racially divided country. 

 

Study Aids & Language Learning 

 

 

Advancedness in Second Language Spanish : Definitions, Challenges, and 
Possibilities 
 

 

This book analyzes the construct of advanced proficiency in second language 

learning by bringing together empirical research from numerous linguistic domains 

and methodological traditions. Focusing on the dynamic nature of language use, 

the volume explores diverse manifestations of high-level second language Spanish, 

including performance on standardized proficiency assessments, acquisition of 

late-acquired linguistic structures, sophisticated language use in context, and 

individual differences. Chapters relate empirical findings to current definitions of 

advancedness, challenging scholars and practitioners to re-consider existing 

conceptualizations, and propose possible directions for future research and 

teaching with second language speakers of Spanish. By addressing larger issues in 

the field of second language learning, the volume is a valuable reference for 

language teachers, scholars, professionals and students with an interest in second 

language acquisition generally, and second language Spanish, more specifically. 



 

Basic Knowledge of English Grammar 
 
The Book has been Design for Acquire Knowledge of English Grammar. Develop 

understanding of desirability of Conducive Environment. Apply guidance ability to 

solve personal, academic and vocational problems. 

 

 


